
2010 – 101 Hot Mix Asphalt 
 
 
Specification/Contractor 

 
Tucci & 

Sons 

 
Granite 

Construction

 
Miles 

Resources 

 
Ace Paving  

 #2 

 
Ace  Paving 

#4 

 
Ace 

Paving #5 

 
Prime 

Asphalt 
 
1. HMA Class ½ “, PG64-22        
Per Ton 
  

 
$48.50 

 
$53.00 

 
$53.90 

 
$54.50 

 
No Bid 

 
$54.50 

 
$65.00 

 
2. HMA CLASS  3/8 “, PG64-
22 Per Ton 
 

 
$48.50 

 
$61.00 

 
$54.90 

 
$54.50 

 
No Bid 

 
$54.50 

 
$67.00 

 
3. COMMERCIAL HMA, Per 
Ton 
 

 
$48.50 

 
$52.00 

 
$53.90 

 
$54.50 

 
$54.50 

 
$54.50 

 
$65.00 
 

 
4. HMA CLASS ½ “PG 64-22, 
(Modified Aggregate) Per Ton 
 

 
$48.50 

 
$52.00 

 
$65.00 

 
$56.19 

 
No Bid 

 
$56.19 

 
$65.00 

 
5. Credit for Recycled Asphalt  
    Per ton 
 

 
 No Bid 

 
$5.00 

 
$2.00 

 
$.84 

 
$.84 

 
$.84 

 
$.25 

 
NOTE:   

1. Miles Resources, LLC dba Woodworth & Company 
2. Ace Paving #2 – Silverdale 
3. Ace Paving #4 – Belfair 
4. Ace Paving #5 - Shine 


